Fiscal Year 2006 BIDS

BID #'s |BID DESCRIPTION DATE / PO# VENDOR COST
TIME
1-06 Roll-Off Truck for Wellford 07/19/05 RE-BID
Landfill 11AM
2-06 Double Bridge Widen/Re- 08-09-05 170806 AT Sistare CONTRACT
location 11AM $444,138.68
3-06 Detachable Gooseneck Trailer |08-02-05 71506 A.E Finley & Assoc $39,280.00(base)
50-ton 11AM
4-06 Pintle Hitch Trailer 12-ton 08-02-05 49406 B & A TRAILERS $6,632.00
11AM
5-06 Hadden Heights Road 08-11-05 2PM|82006 A.T Sistare $169,850.00
Modifications Construction Inc
6-06 Solid Waste Mngt. SVS 08-30-05 2PM CLOSED PER COUNTY]
Landfill (EOI only) COUNCIL
7-06 Wellford MSW Landfill Phase |08-18-05 Contract "A" -Morgan |Contract "A"
V Expansion 2PM Corp $401,444.00
Contract "B"-N/S Contract "B"
Carolina Storage $1,292,633.00
Contract "C"-VSA Contract "C"
Constr.LLC $1,380,682.75
8-06 Cleveland Park Lower Level - |08-23-05 97106 Greer Services LLC $31,440.15
HVAC 11PM
9-06 Cleveland Park Lower Level - |08-23-05 97006 Atherton Electric Co. [$26,145.00
Electrical 11PM
10-06 Cleveland Park Lower Level - |08-23-05 96906 W.N. Kirkland $5,006.40
Plumbing 11PM
11-06 Cleveland Park Lower Level - |08-23-05 141206 Matthew Fowler $41,685.00
General Construction 11PM Drywall
12-06 CAMA Software - Assessors |09-15-05 Contract |Patriot Properties $323,000.00
Office 2PM
13-06 Roll-Off Truck for Wellford 09/06/05 RE-BID
Landfill 11AM
14-06 Ad for Deliquent Tax Sale 2005/09/20-05 Spartanburg Herald .79 cent per ad
11AM Journal
15-06 Renovate 2 single family 09-27-05 OVERBUDGET
homes (CED) 11AM
16-06 CDBG Housing Rehab 09-27-05 NO BID
Program 2PM
17-06 John Deere 544 or similar 4- |09-27-05 163706 Linder Industrial $96,416.00
wheel loader 11AM Equipment Co.
18-06 Voice and Data Installation 10-18-05 184306 A3 Communications |$46,971.50 base
New Sheriff Office 2 PM $500.00 opt. #3
19-06 Stand-By Generator 10-25-05 189206 Continental Engines  [$31,959.40
Emergency Prepareness 11AM
20-06 Cargo Trailer 10-25-05 170606 Carolina Custom $10,173.30 total
Emergency Prepareness 2 PM Trailer
21-06 Spartanburg/Cherokee 11-03-05 Burgess Enterprises  |$29,815.70
Industrial Park Sign 2 PM




22-06 (3) Ladder Shields for Office  [11-01-05 203706 Diamondback $5,400.00
of Emergency 11 AM Tactical
23-06 Caldwell Drive Improvements [11-17 -05 312606 U.S. Azon, Inc $60,750.00
2 AM
24-06 Hydraulic Excavator 11-15-05 OVERBUDGET
Road and Bridges 2 PM
25-06 2006 Mack Granite CV 713 12-15-05 272706 Amick Equipment $120,111.20
or Similar Roll-Off Truck 11AM
26-06 Non-Conductive Articulating 12-29-05 249106 Instrument Tech. $23,945.00
Video Scope 11AM
27-06 Roof Repair for Evans Human |01-19-06 313706 Cannon Roofing $101,660.00
Resource Building 11AM
28-06 Road Resurfacing 01-26-06 RE-BID
"C" Funds 2PM
29-06 Road Resurfacing 01-26-06 327606 King Asphalt $95,756.45
Municipal Funds 2PM
30-06 Road Resurfacing 01-26-06
County Funds 2PM
31-06 Cleveland Park Renovation 02-07-06 306006 Cherokee Acoutics $16,007.25
lower level-Ceiling Tiles 2PM
32-06 Cleveland Park Renovation 02-07-06 306106 Tezza Tile Inc. $9,427.95
lower level-VCT, Floor Tile 2PM
33-06 Cleveland Park Renovation 02-07-06 306206 Upstate Painting $3,461.05
lower level-Painting 2PM
34-06 Cleveland Park Renovation 02-07-06 NO BID
lower level-Finish Carpentry  |2PM
35-06 Willis Road Improvements 02-28-06 360206 Sloan Construction $1,355,000.00
2PM
36-06 Group Health Insurance 02-28-06 Blue Choice Contract
Coverage 2PM
37-06 Spartanburg County Road 02-14-06 327806 King Asphalt $878,649.50
Resurfacing ("C" funds) 2PM
38-06 FY 2006 County Asphalt 03-02-06 OVERBUDGET
Project 2PM
39-06 Road Stripping FY 2006 03-07-06 351606 Interstate Road $48,832.50
11AM Management
40-06 Grinding of Yard Waste for 03-23-06 371606 Dillard Excavating $48,750.00
Solid Wastes-Wellford 11AM
41-06 Conway Black Road Culvert |03-28-06 379406 Chapman Grading and |[$200,680.00
2PM Concrete
42-06 FY 2006 County Asphalt 03-16-06 359706 F & R Asphalt, Inc $517,377.60
Project 2pm
43-06 Wireless Communications NO BID
Services and Equipment for
Communications/ 911
44-06 Concrete Curb / Sidewalk 04-11-06 394906 Chapman Grading and [$14,913.14
Replacement for Idlewood and |2PM Concrete
Sweetbriar Lane
45-06 40 Ft Mobile Command Unti  [05-04-06 464706 Matthews Specialty $382,699.00

2PM

Vehicles




46-06 House Rehab (CED) 05-11-06 BID CANCELLED
221 Fuller Road 11AM
47-06 Posting of Property of 04-27-06 Paradagm Appraisal |Contract
Delinquent Tax Sales 2PM Services
48-06 Summer Food Program for 04-27-06 contract |Canteen Vending 2.56 per serving
2006 Service
49-06 North Spartanburg Complex |04-28-06 425706 D Burns Contracting |$140,252.00
Handicap Parking Area 2PM
50-06 EOC Wiring Project 05-11-06 439606 Veteran $1,245.00
11AM Communcation
51-06 2006 Specialty Vehicle Bomb [05-09-016 454106 Super 1 Specialty $187,241.00
Response Unit Vehicles
52-06 Cleveland Park Hardwood 05-23-06 NO BID
Flooring Project 11AM
53-06 Ben Johnson Road Bridge 06-06-06 486606 Larry Green Grading |$168,906.72
Project 11AM
54-06 Una Infrastructure 06-29-06 Price Construction Inc. {$197,400.00
Project/Haynes Street 11AM Contract
55-06 APD 2000 06-22-06 505806 Smith's Detection $9,765.00
11AM
56-06 Personal Protective Equipment|06-22-06 RE-BID
2 PM
57-06 Four (4) 40 Cubic Yd Open 06-20-06 506906 Bakers Waste $24,691.80
Top Roll Off Containers 11AM Equipment




